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MODERN UKRAINIAN GRAND NARRATIVE:  
PROSPECTS FOR EVOLUTION 

 
Abstract 

 
The article analyzes the features of the modern Ukrainian narrative. Particular attention is paid to inter-

preting the term “grand narrative”. By “grand narrative”, we mean the global intellectual narrative of con-
cepts of experience and knowledge, which emerged in the Enlightenment. The paper notes that the grand 
narrative not only managed to systematize European thinking but has made an intellectual expansion into 
the whole scientific world. Today, the grand narrative is a rather broad concept, and it means a new meth-
od of historiography. The article pays attention to historical research methods: chronological, historical-
comparative and retrospective. The work is formed based on the conclusions of the classics of Ukrainian 
history (M. Hrushevsky) and the grand narratives of modern Ukrainian historians. The results of the study 
show that in Ukraine, several versions of the grand narrative are formed on different scientific principles: 
multiethnic, Eurocentrism, Westernization (modernization), and nationalism. We believe that bringing the 
Ukrainian grand narrative into westernization is undesirable because it significantly limits the heuristic 
potential. But the national-state concept of narrativism has potential in history, as many Ukrainian “sto-
ries” are written under the influence of Soviet stereotypes. Therefore, we believe that today we need to 
rethink narrativism to find a new Ukrainian grand narrative. 

 
Keywords: history, grand narrative, Ukraine, modernity, interpretation, methodology. 
 

 
Introduction 

 
The question of the regeneration of narrative 

(we are talking about Rebirth of Narrative) is 
particularly relevant today in world historiog-
raphy. At the same time, the relationship be-

tween scientific (academic) historiography and 
historical writing has become quite tense. While 
the end of the twentieth-century narrative suf-
fered a heavy blow due to the postmodern rela-
tivism, the studios of popular history have not 
experienced such problems. At the same time, 
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today, the concept of grand narrative has a slight-
ly different content and can even be applied in 
the meaning of a kind of tool for historical re-
search (Kolesnyk, 2008, p. 166). Consequently, 
many Western European historians now interpret 
the grand narrative in the sense of a methodology 
or even a new research method. The latter has 
several functions, particularly the integration of 
history into other human sciences (Strauss, 2005, 
pp. 3-5). 

At the same time, the problem of rethinking 
the history of Ukraine and the formation of a 
new grand concept or grand national narrative is 
quite an acute and urgent problem in contempo-
rary Ukrainian humanitarianism. Additional rel-
evance of our study is provided by the treatment 
of the term “grand narrative”, which is quite am-
biguous and problematic in modern scientific 
studios. Let us note that the search for a new kind 
of grand narrative in Ukrainian historical science 
is connected with some changes nowadays in 
Ukrainian history. First of all, we are talking 
about a departure from the Soviet concepts of its 
writing. At present, there are many modern con-
cepts of Ukrainian “grand narratives,” which fo-
cus on the principles of polyethnicity or the prin-
ciples of Eurocentrism. Thus, our article aims to 
critically analyze the contemporary Ukrainian 
grand narrative through the prism of its forma-
tion and evolutionary changes to highlight the 
main trends in contemporary Ukrainian histori-
ography.  

 
Materials and Methods 

 
To illuminate the problem of the existence of 

the modern Ukrainian narrative, we turn to gen-
eral scientific methods of research, among them - 
analysis, synthesis, induction, and deduction. 
Great attention is paid to the historical research 
method, with the help of which we traced the 
evolution of grand scientific narratives in Ukrai-
nian historiography. The article is also formed 
based on the method of abstraction. The latter 
forms the transition from unrelated concepts to 
concrete conclusions. With the help of the histor-

ical-comparativistic method, we compared diffe-
rent understandings of this complex issue in mo-
dern historiography. 

The methodological basis of the article was 
the universal principles of systematicity, scienti-
ficity, and abstractness. Meanwhile, much atten-
tion was paid to the retrospective and chronolog-
ical research methods, which are quite widely 
used in modern humanitarianism. Through the 
chronological method, the formation of the prin-
ciples of grand narrative in Ukrainian history is 
shown. In addition, the methodological basis of 
our study was formed by the works of the clas-
sics of Ukrainian history. At the same time, the 
article is formed based on the use of modern 
Ukrainian historiography. In particular, the work 
of Kolesnyk (2020) is devoted to the terminolog-
ical features, in particular, the definition of the 
concept of “grand narrative”, “metanarrative”, 
and “narrative”. The current state and specific 
features of the development of modern historical 
science were analyzed by Mereniuk and Parshyn 
(2021). Attempts to improve the classical grand 
narrative of Ukrainian medieval history were 
made by Parshyn (2018). Certain aspects of the 
development of historical scholarship through 
the prism of educational change were analyzed 
by Dahalan and Ahmad (2018). So, the historio-
graphic base of this study is wide enough, and it 
will allow us to thoroughly analyze the evolution 
of the concept of “grand narrative” in the modern 
intellectual environment and the directions of its 
further development.  

 
Results 

The Grand Narrative:  
Peculiarities of Interpretation 

 
Grand narrative literally means “grand narra-

tive”. In historiography, it can be considered that 
the term was first coined by the famous French 
philosopher and thinker Jean-François Lyotard 
(1924-1998). Thus, the concepts of grand narra-
tives became the basis for the critique of histori-
cal scholarship in the era of postmodernism. 
However, this form of criticism (“history is only 
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a text”) was exaggerated to be indigenous or 
non-alternative, and subsequently, the concept 
itself proved successful and took root in the hu-
manities (Browning, 2000, p. 25). In this paper, 
we use the concept of “grand narrative” proposed 
by Jean-François Lyotard in his classic work 
“The State of the Postmodern” (Kolesnyk, 2008, 
pp. 155-156). In this work, the scholar positions 
the grand narrative as a certain standard of histo-
riography, which imposes the unification of the 
components of history. 

At the same time, there is confusion in con-
temporary historical scholarship in terms of ter-
minology. We are talking about different inter-
pretations of the concepts of “grand narrative”, 
“master narrative”, “metanarrative”, “Great His-
tory”, “general scheme”, etc. Note that in West-
ern European studios, the notion of the grand 
narrative refers to a global intellectual text that 
combines concepts of experience and knowledge 
(Strauss, 2005, p. 3; Danilenko et al., 2021). As a 
phenomenon, it emerged in the Enlightenment 
and later became an ideological category of the 
postmodern (given its exact definition), while the 
“metanarrative” in the Modern era distinguishes 
these two concepts. 

The metanarrative is a universal category for-
med based on scientism. The strict metanarrative 
implies using unified principles, laws, causal re-
lations, etc. At the same time, the grand narrative 
in the concept‟s meaning denotes a set of basic 
ideas or categories (Kolesnyk, 2020, pp. 149-
150). The central idea in it is Development, 
which can be represented by various derived cat-
egories, in particular “evolution,” “progress,” 
“revolution,” etc. At the same time, the metanar-
rative has other derivative categories, such as 
“historical peoples,” “non-historical peoples,” 
“cultural and national revival,” etc. The main 
part of such a metanarrative is the principle of 
Eurocentrism, which is reflected in the ideas and 
cultural activities of Old Europe (Kolesnyk, 
2008, p. 156). At the same time, other variants, 
which depend on the carriers of the values of civ-
ilizations (in particular, the United States, Russia, 
etc.) are also common. 

The grand narrative, as a category of the En-
lightenment, not only systematized European 
thinking but carried out an intellectual expansion 
into the world (Browning, 2000, p. 25). At the 
same time, there was an imposition of stereo-
types of thinking that were unique to the West 
(Gurman, 2013). Thus, there was a peculiar dis-
regard for such historiography systems as Arab-
Islamic, East Asian, etc. 

At the same time, since the end of the nine-
teenth century, the rival category of the grand 
narrative system has been the so-called forma-
tional scheme (Dahalan & Ahmad, 2018). The 
latter paid special attention to the role of the eco-
nomic factor in world history. The direct content 
of this theory was represented in such categories 
as “formation”, “production”, “class”, “revolu-
tion”, etc. At the same time, it should be noted 
that the grand narrative models of the twentieth 
century have changed somewhat. We are talking 
about the geohistory of F. Braudel and the theory 
of the third wave of E. Toffler. However, as is 
commonly believed, all this ended with some 
pessimistic expectations in the example of F. Fu-
kuyama‟s theory of “the end of history” (Kole-
snyk, 2008, pp.157-158). Thus, to summarize, 
the classical grand narrative is a peculiar way of 
reconstructing history, when a large or medium 
(small) scheme was “thrown” on certain histori-
cal “raw material”. 

 
The Formation of the Ukrainian  

Grand Narrative 
 
As for Ukrainian historical thought, the origi-

nal grand narrative embodied the idea of Rus-
sia‟s special place and its significance among 
other nations, including Western Europe. Thus, 
the priority of the Ukrainian grand narrative was 
the very history of Ukraine from its earliest 
times. Within the framework of modernism, the 
first important grand narrative appears in the are-
na of historiography - the “History of Ukraine-
Rus” by M. Hrushevsky (Mereniuk, 2021). He 
formed a fundamental and scientifically ground-
ed scheme of Ukrainian history, the key catego-
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ries of hardship and continuity (Wynar, 1987). In 
part, it could be argued that the origins of the 
grand narrative are contained in the works of 
such Ukrainian historians as M. Kostomarov, M. 
Maksymovych, V. Antonovich, and P. Kulish, 
etc. 

However, it was M. Hrushevsky, having sys-
tematized the experience of the mentioned pre-
decessors, who first formed a powerful concept 
of the Ukrainian grand narrative. His theory was 
formed in sharp disputes with the imperial Rus-
sian historiography of that time, which had fully 
owned the history of Russia. 

In The History of Ukraine-Ruh, a 10-volume 
monograph, M. Hrushevsky focused on the his-
tory of Ukraine from ancient times to the second 
half of the seventeenth century (Wynar, 1987). 
He devoted scientific articles and several source 
studies to the theoretical justification of the inde-
pendence of the historical development of the 
Ukrainian people as a separate nation. He sub-
jected a crushing criticism of the concept of “all-
Russian” nationality and its history. He believed 
that Russian historical thought neglected the true 
development of the Ukrainian and Belarusian 
peoples. The latter was a particular manifestation 
of the so-called Russian chauvinism. To popular-
ize the developed concept of the past, M. Hru-
shevsky wrote several books and articles pub-
lished in different languages, particularly Ukrain-
ian, German, French, English, Bulgarian, and 
Czech. Among these works, we should mention 
“Essays on the History of Ukrainian People” 
(1904), “Brief History of Ukraine” (1910), “Il-
lustrated History of Ukraine” (1911), etc. A 
characteristic feature of the then Ukrainian grand 
narrative was that a large number of written sour-
ces: chronicles and ancient documents were fo-
und and first published by their authors. The mo-
tivation of such studies is largely dictated by the 
need to show the state‟s history as more ancient. 
Such motive can be explained by the interest of 
historians in the ancient times of statehood 
(Hrushevsky & Pasicznyk, 1997).  

So, the grand narrative, the great history of 
ancient Ukraine, formed the basic context and 

laid the basic principles of large monographic 
studies devoted to the actual problems of Ukrain-
ian historical thought (Mereniuk, 2021). Firstly, 
it was possible due to the source base used and 
later served as a basis for forming monographic, 
thematic-generalizing historical studies. In par-
ticular, in the works of I. Krypiakevych, M. Kor-
duba, I. Dzhydzhora ta I. Kryvetskyi.  

Note that the works of the Ukrainian historian 
I. Krypiakevych contains broad grand narrative 
principles of text construction. His popular scien-
tific essays, for example, “The Great History of 
Ukraine” and “A Brief History of Ukraine”, do 
not lose their relevance until now. In addition, 
this historian formed a kind of scientific basis for 
the further development of the military history of 
Ukraine. He did not manage to realize his inten-
tions for objective reasons. The defeat of the 
Ukrainian liberation struggle of 1918-1921 led to 
the occupation of Ukrainian territory and in-
creased censorship (Lytvyn, 2019, p. 233). Ac-
cordingly, it was not possible for a scholar in in-
terwar Poland to publish broader grand narrative 
essays on the history of Ukraine. This would 
have been an official challenge to the Polish au-
thorities and would have led to his imprison-
ment. When I. Krypiakevych became a Soviet 
historian and professor at the University of Lviv 
after World War II, the project of writing a com-
prehensive Ukrainian history became even more 
difficult to realize than in interwar Poland (Lyt-
vyn, 2019, p. 234). For a long time, the histori-
an‟s work was either not needed or was pub-
lished partially in the form of separate articles. In 
fact, only after 1991 was it possible to republish 
his works, partially unspoiled by Soviet censor-
ship. Although much of it still requires conceptu-
al reconsideration.  

Although the concept mentioned earlier by 
M. Hrushevsky became the first weighty Ukrain-
ian grand narrative, as modern Ukrainian histori-
ans argue, it had a certain inconsistency with the 
European historiographical movement. Ukraini-
an historian I. Lysiak-Rudnytskywas the first to 
write about it. He pointed out that in the Ukraini-
an grand narrative of M. Hrushevskythe Lithua-
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nian, Polish, and later Cossack era had no corre-
spondences in the historical texts of other nations 
(Lysyak-Rudnytsky, 1994). He believed this fact 
isolated the Ukrainian historical grand narrative 
from a broader interpretation. He divided his mo-
del into 1. Ancient and medieval history. Here 
appeared the sub-periods of KievanRus‟ and lat-
er the Galicia-Volhynia kingdom. The most re-
cent is purely the first Ukrainian state; the third 
sub-period is the Lithuanian era. 2. Early period 
(until the end of the eighteenth century). 3. Uk-
raine in the nineteenth century. 4. Ukraine in the 
20th century (Kolesnyk, 2008, pp. 158-159). At 
the same time, in my opinion. Lysiak-Rudnyt-
sky, the main problem of the modern history of 
Ukraine is the process of the formation of the 
nation, the transformation of the ethnolinguistic 
community into a united and self-conscious com-
munity (Lysyak-Rudnytsky, 1994). 

Thus, we believe that the first weighty grand 
narrative work is M. Hrushevsky‟s History of 
Ukraine-Rusa. However, it is accepted in histori-
ography that his works were not classical Euro-
pean narratives. I. Lysiak-Rudnytsky, who 
formed his scheme of the history of Ukraine 
based on European historiography, was one of 
the first to point out the inconsistency of Hru-
shevsky‟s grand narrative. These were the first 
serious grandiose attempts in Ukrainian history. 
In the future, other concepts of narratives will in-
fluence the formation of the modern Ukrainian 
grand narrative.  

 
Modern Ukrainian Narrative 

 
Several approaches remain popular in the 

contemporary Ukrainian narrative. It is quite 
common to interpret the nationality of history 
through the prism of multiperspective and multi-
ethnicity. A prominent representative of this ap-
proach is the Canadian historian P. Magocsi. In 
his works, he defends the theoretical foundations 
that existing histories about Ukraine‟s past are 
stories about a purely Ukrainian nation (in the 
meaning of the subject of history), but not stories 
about the history of the territory on which Uk-

raine now stands (Magocsi, 2010). This historian 
calls his grand narrative the first historical work 
that depicts the development of all nationalities 
that settled on Ukrainian territory (Magocsi, 
2010, p. 12). It should be noted that the narra-
tives of P. Magocsi are similar to modern Euro-
pean grand narratives.  

Another famous historian of Ukrainian origin 
who lived and worked in Canada was O. Subtel-
nyi. His thorough and written in a lively literary 
style, “History of Ukraine” was a real event in 
the Ukrainian scientific life of the early 1990s. 
Compared with the “old” Soviet histories, it was 
characterized by the depth of interpretation, a 
thorough erudition of the author, literary talent, 
and a fresh look at historical events little known 
in Ukrainian society of that time. His concept of 
the grand narrative is written through the prism 
of the views of M. Hrushevsky (he also used the 
definition of “princely epoch”, “Polish-Lithua-
nian epoch”, etc.), but in its essence, it was filled 
with sorrow for the statelessness of the Ukrainian 
people, and quite critical of the Ukrainian elite of 
different times. The influence of Westernization 
processes, then still unknown in Ukrainian histo-
riography, can be felt in his work. It should be 
noted that the popularity of this edition was very 
high. For a long time, O. Subtelnyi‟s work be-
came an unofficial textbook in Ukrainian 
schools, and the author‟s conclusions on various 
issues were quoted even in dissertation studies.  

Ya. Dashkevych‟s concept of historical de-
velopment. Dashkevych also incorporates the 
foundations of the grand narrative. His theory of 
national history is built on the principles of state 
relativism. In particular, in his interpretation, the 
general history of Ukraine includes alternation of 
epochs of statelessness and statehood (Kolesnyk, 
2008, p. 156). The views of Ya. Dashkevych‟s 
views completely contradicted the influence of 
the 1990s old Soviet history. He believed that the 
artificial increase of periods of statelessness in 
the Ukrainian nation was a dirty game to the det-
riment of all Ukrainians. This “dirty game” was 
led by unprincipled opportunistic historians, 
who, in many things, followed the official ideol-
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ogy rather than the real historical facts.  
Ⱥ��.DSSHOHU��ZKR�ZURWH�$�6PDOO�+LVWRU\�RI�

Ukraine, has shaped his narrative on poly-pers-
pective principles. The author integrated the de-
velopment of various ethnic groups into his con-
cept of Ukrainian history. In particular, the work 
pays special attention to Poles, Russians, Jews, 
and Germans, all nationalities that lived in Uk-
raine in different periods (Kappeler, 2014). Most 
contemporary narrative works by Ukrainian his-
torians focus a great deal of attention on the con-
tent of polyethnicity and Eurocentrism.  

An attempt to revive grand narrative texts 
throughout the 1990s was the conclusion of the 
VHULHV�³8NUDLQH�7KURXJK�WKH�$JHV´�� ,W�ZDV�VXg-
gested that authors of specialists from different 
periods of history would create a thorough selec-
tion of books from the past of the Ukrainian land 
from primitive times to the present. The project 
united quite a variety of scientists, the results of 
whose work, we note, were criticized. At the 
VDPH�WLPH��WKH�SURMHFW�³8NUDLQH�WKURXgh the Ag-
HV´�ZDV�DEOH�WR�VDWLVI\�WKH�JUHDW�KLVWRULRJUDSKLFDO�
need of the then society.  

Renowned contemporary historian Ya. Hryt-
sak puts forward his concept of modern Ukraini-
an history. His history is built on the principles of 
modernization change or westernization (Hryt-
sak, 2019). He notes that modernization process-
es outside of Western Europe are transformed in-
to westernization. It is a kind of copying of Euro-
pean principles given their effectiveness (Hryt-
sak, 2019, p. 123). In his concept, the fundamen-
tal thesis is the opinion that without a weighty 
Western influence, Ukraine could not have 
emerged (Kolesnyk, 2008, pp. 165-166). Alt-
hough, according to Ya. Hrytsak, there could be 
VRPH�DOWHUQDWLYH��LQ�SDUWLFXODU��³5XVVLDQ�FLYLOL]a-
WLRQ´� RU� ³5XVVLDQ VRFLHW\´�� EXW� ³TXLWH� LQDUWLFu-
ODWH´��+H�EHJLQV�KLV�PRGHUQ�KLVWRU\�RI�8NUDLQLDQ�
lands with the discovery of America (which, ac-
cording to the author, is the main event in both 
European and Ukrainian history). Later on, Ya. 
Hrytsak (2019) notes that Ukraine, due to all 
transformational changes, is a peculiar product of 
Westernization processes (pp. 131-132). In his 

concept, the historian takes the theory of civiliza-
tional mission as a basis, particularly in Europe. 
In addition, he applies to Ukraine a peculiar met-
aphor of a slow snail, which, although slowly, is 
³FUDZOLQJ´�WRZDUGV�:HVWHUQ�FLYLOL]DWLRQ�� 

At the same time, the contemporary Ukraini-
an grand narrative is also built based on tradi-
tions of national-state concepts. It should be not-
ed that such a national principle of the formation 
RI�WKH�³JUHDW�KLVWRU\´�ILQGV�D�SURPLQHQW�SODFH�LQ�
contemporary Ukrainian textbooks, manuals, and 
monographic studies (Kolesnyk, 2008, p. 159). 
At the same time, one of the principles of mod-
ern grand narrative works is an attempt to fit the 
history of the development of Ukrainian lands 
into general historical processes. This is caused 
by the fact that for quite a long time in Ukraine, 
history has been explained through the principles 
of Soviet theories.  

Consequently, many textbooks, manuals, and 
monographs were written based on accepted So-
viet concepts. Ukrainian historians are trying to 
overcome Soviet teaching and writing history 
principles. Consequently, modern researchers try 
to pay much attention to the development of Uk-
raine through the prism of general European 
transformations to characterize the history of Uk-
raine as a separate world (European) phenome-
non. In addition, the Ukrainian specialists in the 
study of ancient Russia note the Ukrainian herit-
age of the history of Russia, especially concerns 
the history of the Galitsko-Volynsk state, which, 
as it is commonly believed, is the first purely Uk-
rainian state. A great contribution to developing 
this nation-state concept is a monographic study 
by I. Parshyn, who investigated the development 
of the Galicia-Volhynia state through the prism 
of the analysis of diplomatic relations (Parshyn, 
2020). The author substantiated in detail the Eu-
rocentricity of the Galicia-Volhynia state. Study-
ing European Latin medieval sources I. Parshyn 
noted that the princes and kings of the Galicia-
Volhynia state were known in many European 
countries, so their power was mentioned many 
times by European chroniclers (Parshyn, 2018, 
p. 12). As scholars of the world, it is necessary to 
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integrate their national history into world history.  
At the same time, we note that when writing 

world histories, Ukrainian historians should also 
pay great attention to the changes that took place 
in Ukrainian territories. Consequently, when de-
scribing world-historical events, we should not 
forget about the analysis of those transformations 
that took place in Ukraine at that time. We be-
lieve that this approach should guide modern 
Ukrainian textbooks, many of which are written 
according to the Soviet cliché.  

 
Discussion 

 
The theme of grand narrative is undoubtedly 

relevant for contemporary studios. Making sense 
of the past of entire countries or peoples requires 
a specific methodology, which cannot always be 
adhered to. After all, the choice of relevant ways 
to achieve a scientific goal and its establishment 
is a matter of a kind of brand. Contemporary top-
ics of historical research also have a certain “fa-
shion”. It is doubtful that the writing of universal 
and thorough historical studies today can be con-
sidered its latest manifestations (Danziger, 2012). 
On a scholarly level, world histories that fit into 
the format of a single well-illustrated book are 
popular. Perhaps this can be considered the first 
hint of a return to large texts, not articles. Obvi-
ously, readers‟ (consumers‟) sympathies are in-
clined toward holistic studies rather than individ-
ual pieces; accordingly, the value of grand narra-
tives will also grow.  

The difficulty in writing them, in our opinion, 
lies in the fact that many of the authors of really 
outstanding studies were simultaneously the dis-
coverers of these or those sources. This gave 
them the right to broadly interpret the material 
obtained, compare it with other studies, and fit it 
into the existing texts‟ proof (or refutation). The 
modern studies in the source study component 
are considerably inferior to the works of the 
XIX-early XX century. (This is especially true 
for Ukrainian history). In fact, many monuments 
of the Antiquity, Middle Ages, or New Age were 
first published in this period. Thanks to this, his-

torians had a wide opportunity to use new infor-
mation, which, in turn, opened up the possibility 
of a wider conclusion and the construction of ori-
ginal concepts. On this basis (and using the tho-
rough erudition of researchers), it was possible to 
find a whole people in history, as M. Hrushev-
sky, for example, did. The first books of his 
grand narrative, “History of Ukraine-Russa”, is 
written in a somewhat survey style if we com-
pare them with the following volumes, which 
dealt with the Cossack and Hetman state (Wynar, 
1987). At the same time, even in this form, they 
do not lose their scientific weight and are quite 
relevant for citation.  

At the same time, when most archival materi-
als have already been put into scholarly use, it is 
much more difficult to write works of this kind. 
The modern historian pays more attention to in-
terpreting sources than to working with them in-
dependently. For this reason, it is difficult to 
write chronologically broad texts. Obviously, 
there is a need not only for search work but also 
for new possibilities for interpreting monuments. 

The modern trend of postmodern historiog-
raphy can bring a new vision and a critical under-
standing of already known sources (Browning, 
2000). At the same time, many efforts have 
turned to microhistory, the history of things, and 
the like. These promising avenues of research 
will not be able to produce a grand narrative, alt-
hough they are capable of bringing much fresh 
information to already known studios. Perhaps 
they themselves emerged as a result of a con-
scious rejection of “big texts”. In our opinion, 
however, advances in modern source studies will 
facilitate a return to the grand narrative. 

Ukrainian historians are in a certain advanta-
geous position because for a long time, the histo-
ry of Ukraine has been taboo for authentic re-
search. Accordingly, the discovery of new sour-
ces is quite possible. This could provide an impe-
tus for the creation of substantial new research, 
as opposed to the “histories” already written un-
der Soviet influence. The rethinking of the 
known (and the discovery of the unknown) writ-
ten and archaeological heritage will reveal new 



30WISDOM - Special Issue 2(3), 2022 
Philosophy of Language and Literature

Yuliya DOBROLYUBSKA, Oleksii PRYSIAZHNIUK, Maria RODIAN, Yana SEMKO

ϯϬ�

facts and overcome clichés. Although some his-
torians (Ya. Hrytsak, P. Magocsi) suggest con-
sciously abandoning the Ukrainian discourse in 
favour of westernization or description of the 
past of minorities of Ukraine, in our opinion, the 
state vector of historiography will be decisive for 
the revival of “big texts” in Ukraine and perhaps 
in the territory of former Soviet republics in gen-
eral. 

We understand and hold true the poly-pers-
pective principles of A. Kappeler. However, we 
believe that attempts to integrate the history of 
Ukraine and the history of individual ethnic gro-
ups are more evidence of the extensive develop-
ment of science. A mechanistic increase in the 
research object does not automatically lead to the 
creation of a grand narrative. On the contrary, 
following the way of improvement and expan-
sion of the source base, serious progress can also 
be achieved in the theoretical plane.  

 
Conclusion 

 
Thus, the characteristic feature of contempo-

rary Ukrainian historiography is the appeal to the 
problem of the grand narrative. Let us note that 
the search for new types of historiography is as-
sociated with systemic changes in Ukrainian his-
torical science, particularly regarding the de-
communization and derussianization of the past. 
It was a departure from the Soviet concepts of 
description and narration. In particular, many 
approaches to creating new Ukrainian “grand 
narratives” are being discussed today. Among 
them, the principles of polyethnicity, Eurocen-
trism, and state direction predominate. Based on 
the critical analysis of the state of modern histo-
riography (taking into account its evolutionary 
changes and new tendencies), it is noted that the 
emergence of the grand narrative in Ukraine took 
place at the beginning of the XX century when 
M. Hrushevsky wrote, “The History of Ukraine-
Rus”.His work still gives rise to discussions, par-
ticularly about the need for the revival of this 
type of work in the following. 

In the example of the analysis of actual tho-

ughts (Ya. Hrytsak, P. Magocsi, etc.), an ambig-
uous attitude to the grand narrative is conducted. 
The Eurocentric aspirations of these researchers 
regarding the pro-Western interpretation of the 
history of Ukraine are summarized. Foreigners 
(A. Kappeler) also have a suitable place in it. At 
the same time, the state potential of grand narra-
tive writing is demonstrated, which, in our opin-
ion, is quite promising. 

Among practical recommendations, we note 
the need to integrate Ukrainian history into world 
history. At the same time, we note that when wri-
ting world histories, Ukrainian historians should 
also pay great attention to the changes that took 
place in Ukrainian territories. An important basis 
for describing the history of Ukraine is the refer-
ence to similar events in Europe and the world, 
which will allow us to interpret them in detail. 
We believe this approach should become a sig-
nificant tool in writing Ukrainian textbooks and 
summaries of history.  
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